



# Rutland County Council

Rutland County Council  
Catmose  
Oakham  
Rutland  
LE15 6HP

telephone: 01572 722 577  
fax: 01572 758 307  
email: [FOI@rutland.gov.uk](mailto:FOI@rutland.gov.uk)  
web: [www.rutland.gov.uk](http://www.rutland.gov.uk)

19 February 2019

## FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST – 154/19

Dear Sir/Madam

Your request for information has now been considered and the information requested is provided below.

Request / Response:

Complaints to Magistrates for Council Tax (CT) Liability Orders.

Going as far back as is reasonable (eg 5 years), up to the most recent data available, Please could you provide me with a table of information under the following headings:-

1. Date Of hearing
2. Number of CT Accounts Listed on a Complaint
3. Total Court fee paid
4. length of hearing - defended/undefended
5. Number of CT accounts Liability Order made against
6. Total costs awarded to Billing authority
7. Actual cost of preparing for and attending the hearing.
8. Number of Accounts in name of a Limited Company?

Answer:

Please refer to attached spreadsheet.

You are free to use any documents supplied for your own use, including for non-commercial research purposes. The documents may also be used for news reporting. However, any other type of re-use, for example by publishing the documents or issuing copies to the public will require the permission of the copyright owner, where copyright exists. Such a request would be considered separately in accordance with the relevant Re-use of Public Sector Information Regulations 2005 and is not automatic. Therefore, no permission is implied in the re-use of this information, until such a request to re-use it has been made and agreed, subject to any appropriate conditions. Any request to re-use the information should be made to me at the address below.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request please contact the Data Protection Officer, Rutland County Council, Catmose, Oakham, Rutland LE15 6HP  
You can also complain to the Information Commissioner at:



The Information Commissioner's Office  
Wycliffe House, Water lane  
Wilmslow, Cheshire  
SK9 5AF  
Tel: 01625 545700

Yours faithfully

FOI Administrator  
Business Support Team  
Rutland County Council

Date of Hearing	Number of Council Tax a/cs on Complaint	Total Court Fee Paid	Length of Hearing	Number of Council Tax Accounts L/O Made Against	Total Costs Awarded to BA	Costs of Preparing for and Attending Hearing	No of Accounts in Name of Ltd Co	Year
29/05/2014	75	£225.00	data not held	29	£2,030.00	£1,805.00	2	2014
26/06/2014	309	£927.00	data not held	247	£17,290.00	£16,363.00	0	2014
24/07/2014	86	£258.00	data not held	96	£6,720.00	£6,462.00	0	2014
28/08/2014	65	£195.00	data not held	36	£2,520.00	£2,325.00	0	2014
25/09/2014	32	£96.00	data not held	24	£1,680.00	£1,584.00	0	2014
30/10/2014	65	£195.00	data not held	62	£4,340.00	£4,145.00	0	2014
27/11/2014	49	£147.00	data not held	37	£2,590.00	£2,443.00	0	2014
11/12/2014	62	£186.00	data not held	0 adjourned			0	2014
29/01/2015	82	£246.00	data not held	99	£6,930.00	£6,684.00	0	2014
26/02/2015	37	£111.00	data not held	18	£1,260.00	£1,149.00	0	2014
26/03/2015	79	£237.00	data not held	30	£2,100.00	£1,863.00	20	2014
24/04/2015	82	£246.00	data not held	50	£3,500.00	£3,254.00	0	2015
20/05/2015	309	£927.00	data not held	239	£16,969.00	£16,042.00	2	2015
25/06/2015	99	£297.00	data not held	87	£6,177.00	£5,880.00	0	2015
23/07/2015	81	£243.00	data not held	58	£4,118.00	£3,875.00	0	2015
27/05/2015	68	£204.00	data not held	50	£3,550.00	£3,346.00	5	2015
24/09/2015	43	£129.00	data not held	31	£2,201.00	£2,072.00	0	2015
22/10/2015	52	£156.00	data not held	30	£2,070.00	£1,914.00	2	2015
26/11/2015	65	£195.00	data not held	47	£3,243.00	£3,048.00	0	2015
10/12/2015	67	£201.00	data not held	42	£2,898.00	£2,697.00	0	2015
21/01/2016	62	£186.00	data not held	32	£2,208.00	£2,022.00	0	2015
25/02/2016	61	£183.00	data not held	40	£2,760.00	£2,577.00	4	2015
31/03/2016	22	£66.00	data not held	19	£1,311.00	£1,245.00	0	2015
21/04/2016	26	£78.00	data not held	19	£1,311.00	£1,233.00	0	2016
19/05/2016	317	£951.00	data not held	237	£16,353.00	£15,402.00	3	2016
21/07/2016	127	£381.00	data not held	87	£6,003.00	£5,622.00	0	2016
24/08/2016	60	£180.00	data not held	41	£2,829.00	£2,649.00	0	2016
21/09/2016	55	£165.00	data not held	36	£2,484.00	£2,319.00	0	2016
19/10/2016	48	£144.00	data not held	73	£5,037.00	£4,893.00	0	2016
23/11/2016	37	£111.00	data not held	37	£2,553.00	£2,442.00	0	2016
22/02/2017	84	£252.00	data not held	73	£5,037.00	£4,785.00	0	2016
22/03/2017	70	£210.00	data not held	46	£3,174.00	£2,964.00	0	2016
19/04/2017	47	£141.00	data not held	26	£1,794.00	£1,653.00	1	2017
24/05/2017	41	£123.00	data not held	25	£1,725.00	£1,602.00	0	2017
19/07/2017	261	£783.00	data not held	216	£14,904.00	£14,121.00	0	2017
23/08/2017	112	£336.00	data not held	70	£4,830.00	£4,494.00	0	2017
18/10/2017	98	£294.00	data not held	52	£3,588.00	£3,294.00	0	2017
22/11/2017	27	£81.00	data not held	17	£1,173.00	£1,092.00	0	2017
21/02/2018	27	£81.00	data not held	76	£5,244.00	£5,163.00	0	2017
18/04/2018	177	£531.00	data not held	91	£6,279.00	£5,748.00	7	2018
23/05/2018	198	£594.00	data not held	99	£6,831.00	£6,237.00	0	2018
20/06/2018	224	£672.00	data not held	224	£15,456.00	£14,784.00	0	2018
22/08/2018	198	£594.00	data not held	119	£8,211.00	£7,617.00	5	2018
19/09/2018	90	£45.00	data not held	46	£2,990.00	£2,945.00	1	2018
17/10/2018	73	£36.50	data not held	59	£3,835.00	£3,798.50	1	2018
21/11/2018	110	£55.00	data not held	48	£3,120.00	£3,065.00	0	2018